
Town of Warrenton Bid Tabulation

Date/Time 9/15/2005 2:00 PM
IFB Number / Description: 05-010 Aquatic Recreation Facility
Bids Opened by: Rick Heartley
Bids Tabulated by: Chris Bogert

Bidder

Bid Reference Description

Forrester 
Construction Co

Hess Construction 
Company

W. M. Scholsser 
Company Inc.

Total Base Bid 22,288,000.00   22,490,000.00   25,844,000.00   
Alternate No. 1 Lake 820,721.00        669,000.00        705,000.00        
Alternate No. 2 Concession Building 267,500.00        267,500.00        267,500.00        
Alternate No. 3 Zeolite Filter Media 8,660.00            14,000.00          11,000.00          
Alternate No. 4 Spring Boards and Stands 27,145.00          24,000.00          23,000.00          
Alternate No. 5 Untraviolet Decholramination and D 90,866.00          92,000.00          78,000.00          
Unit Price No. 1 (cy) Soil Relocation 8.00                    6.60                   10.00                 
Unit Price No. 2 (cy) Soil Relocation 40.00                  35.20                 42.00                 
Unit Pirce No. 3 (cy) Borrow Soil 45.00                  33.00                 40.00                 
Unit Price No. 4 Plants * * *
Unit Pirce No. 5 (cy) Rock Excavation 83.00                  No Bid No Bid

* Individual listing not included on this bid tabulation.

Provide  Aluminum Inner ductwork for PHU 1 & 2 per MO.02 121,625.00        No Bid No Bid

Bidder


