
TOWN OF WARRENTON BID EVALUATION 
 
DATE/ TIME July 2, 2010/  2PM 

IFB #/ DESCRIPTION: IFB 11-002/ WWTP & WTP Chemicals 

BIDS OPENED BY: Allen Chichester 

BIDS TABULATED BY: Joan M. Jackson 
 

 

BIDDER  
NAME Chlorine Soda 

Ash Lime Sodium 
Hexametaphosphate 

Hyrofluosilcic 
Acid 

Copper 
Sulfate 

Potassium 
Permanganate 

Caustic 
Soda 
Liquid 

HTH Methanol Praestol 
857 
Polymer 

Praestol 
2540 
Polymer 

Delta 
Chemical No Bid No Bid No 

Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Coyne 
Chemical No Bid $15.98/ 

bag 
$8.36/ 
bag 

$68.20/bag 
CP-65D 

$97.28/ 
drum 

$107.60/ 
Bag 

$118.63/ 
Pail 

$300.71/ 
Drum 

$2.145/ 
lb 
PPG 
Induclor 

No Bid 

$2.394/  
Lb. 
Zetag 
7593 

$1.873/ 
lb. 
Magnafloc 
1011 

Univar $1,650/ 
Ton 

$13.50/ 
Bag 

$7.50/ 
Bag $78.00/ bag 

$82.50/ 
150 lb. 
drum 

$94.00/ 
Bag 

$176.37/ 
Pail 

$129.20/ 
680 lb. 
Drum 

$52.50/ 
Pail 

$1.65/ 
gal. or 
see 
below 

$3.34/ 
Lb. 

$1.94/ lb 
 

 


